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Note: 
All details and data presented in this information sheet are based on our practical experience and laboratory investigations, and reflect the current state of the art. 

They can, however, only serve as general guidance and shall provide no guarantee of specific properties or performance. Given that the conditions for storage, 

transportation and application of products are beyond our control, no legal liability may be construed from the information presented here. It shall be the responsibility 

of the user to check the product's suitability for the envisaged purpose under the specific site or project conditions. 

Technical Information 

 
synthetic resin-modified white filling compound 
 

 for facades and damp spaces, for filling and smoothing 
 

 white, high filling power, waterproof and frost-resistant 
 

 
Use 

 

For overcoating uneven substrates, for filling cracks and 
holes in indoor and outdoor mineral walls and ceilings. 
 
 

Constituents 
 

Portland cement, synthetic resin dispersion powder, ad-
ditives 
 

Substrate 
 

For application to concrete, aerated concrete, masonry, 
gypsum plaster, cement render and lime render, insula-
tion, rigid foam and lightweight board. For mineral sub-
strates only. Not suitable for application to glass, plastics 
and metal. 
All substrates shall be dry, clean, level, strong, absorbent 
and free from adhesion-impairing substances. To increase 
strength, use baufan® Deeply Penetrating Primer – sol-
vent-free. Completely remove any substrates that cannot 
be stabilized or that adhere inadequately. In case of 
doubt, perform trial application. 
 

Application 
 

Slowly sprinkle baufan® Outdoor Filler into clear water in 
clean mixing container and stir until pasty, lump-free 
compound is achieved. Mixing ratio for 1.0 kg baufan® 
Outdoor Filler: filling, coating – approx. 0.3 to 0.4 ltr wa-
ter. 
After mixing, allow to mature for approx. 1 minute, then 

restir. Prepared material is workable for approx. 4 hours 
and shall not be subsequently diluted. Apply with spatula, 
trowel or the like in any coat thickness. Wash tools with 
fresh water immediately after use. 
 

Subsequent coating and bonding shall only be performed 
after filler-coated surface has fully dried. Observance of 
coating and adhesive manufacturers' instructions for pre-
treatment of cementitious substrates is essential. 
 
Consumption: 
 

Per mm coat thickness  → approx. 1.5 kg/m² 
 

Application temperature 
 

+5 °C to + 30 °C for material, ambient air and substrate 
 

Open time: 
 

workable for approx. 4 – 5 hours 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
Drying time 
 

Approx. 12 hours per mm coat thickness under normal 
conditions (at +20 °C, 65 % relative humidity and mod-
erately absorbent substrate); allow suitably longer drying 
times for unfavourable conditions. 
 

Note  
 

   
 

Labelling: corrosive - danger. Causes skin irritation. 
Causes serious eye damage. May cause respiratory irrita-
tion. Keep out of reach of children. Avoid breathing dust. 
Wear protective gloves/protective clothing/eye protec-
tion. Do not get in eyes, on skin, or on clothing. If in eyes: 
Rinse cautiously with water for several minutes. Remove 
contact lenses, if present and easy to do. If on skin: Wash 
with plenty of water and soap. If medical advice is 
needed, have product container or label at hand. Do not 
allow to enter drains, sewers, surface waters or ground. 
Hand over only fully emptied containers for recycling. 
 

Contains: Portland cement 
GISCODE (German hazardous substances classification): 
ZP1 - low-chromate to TRGS 613 
 

Storage 
 

Store in cool, though frost-free environment in properly 
sealed containers. Minimum shelf life in unopened con-
tainers subject to proper storage: 48 months from pro-
duction date (see batch label). 
 

Item No.   

101346 
101322 
 

1.0 kg 
5.0 kg 

 

Folding box 
Paper bag 
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